



Tuesday, May 07, 2019

Pothole Patching for the Road Dept  
 BID 2019-09



VELOCITY		
VENDOR INFORMATION		
Bid Signed	Insurance	Security
YES	NO	YES
List Checked Off		
YES	Labor Only	Total (Labor and Material)
Cold Patch		
Cost per Square Foot	NO BID	
Cost per Square Yard	NO BID	
Cost per Ton	NO BID	
Hot Patch		
Cost per Square Foot	NO BID	
Cost per Square Yard	NO BID	
Cost per Ton	NO BID	
Emulsion Patch		
Cost per Square Foot	\$3.50	\$7.00
Cost per Square Yard	\$30.00	\$60.00
Cost per Ton	\$500.00	\$1,000.00
Full Depth Reclamation Patch		
Cost per Square Foot	NO BID	
Cost per Square Yard	NO BID	
Cost per Ton	NO BID	

HUTCHENS CONSTRUCTION Co.		
VENDOR INFORMATION		
Bid Signed	Insurance	Security
YES	YES	YES
List Checked Off		
YES	Labor Only	Total (Labor and Material)
Cold Patch		
Cost per Square Foot	\$6.60	\$9.20
Cost per Square Yard	\$59.40	\$82.50
Cost per Ton	\$270	\$375.00
Hot Patch		
Cost per Square Foot	\$6.60	\$8.50
Cost per Square Yard	\$59.40	\$76.00
Cost per Ton	\$270	\$345.00
Emulsion Patch		
Cost per Square Foot	\$4.00	\$6.00
Cost per Square Yard	\$36.00	\$54.00
Cost per Ton	\$490.00	\$600.00
Full Depth Reclamation Patch		
Cost per Square Foot	\$21.25	\$25.00
Cost per Square Yard	\$190.00	\$225.00
Cost per Ton	\$425.00	\$500.00